TOWN OF WEST SENECA

TOWN SUPERVISOR
SHEHLA M. MEEGAN

TOWN COUNCIL
EUGENE P, HART

ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT WILLIAM P. HANLEY JR,

February 3, 2014

Honorable Town Board
Town of West Seneca

Honorable Board Members,

As part of the Town of West Seneca’s ongoing Order on Consent with the New York State Department of
Environmental Conservation, we are proposing to rehabilitate the existing sewer mains by way of the Phase
4 Sewer Rehabilitation Project.

We would like to complete a smoke testing investigation and report in order to determine the conditions of
the sewer mains and service laterals, and to identify sources of non-sanitary sewage contribution within the
project area. We have obtained three (3) separate quotes for this work (see attached). Please note smoke
testing was previously completed for Phases 1, 2, & 3 Sewer Rehabilitation Projects.

Sewer Specialty Services Company, Inc. has provided a proposal to complete the work for $0.32 per linear
foot of sewer main, for an estimated total of $32,000 (based on an estimated footage of 100,000 linear feet).
The final amount shall be based on actual footage of sewers smoke tested. Funding for this work is budgeted
under the $30M capital sewer project.

Please authorize Sewer Specialty Services Company, Inc. to perform the smoke testing work included in the
attached proposal.

Feel free to contact me if you have any questions.
Very truly yours,

Gpion Q™

Jason A. Foote, P.E.
Town Engineer

cc. Files: TB
Project
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” : Sewer Bpociaity Sorvices s meny, lmnc.

2462 New Road Phone: (585) 382-3141
Leicester, New York 14481 Fax: (585) 382-3082
1/30/2014
Clark Patterson Lee

Gkatkowsky@clarkpatierson.com

Attention: George Kalkowsky
Subject: Price Quotation
Smoke Testing
Approximately 100,000 LF 8+"
West Seneca, NY
Dear Mr. Kalkowsky:
As per your reqUest, regarding the above captioned subject, | wish to quote the following:
100,000 LF Smoke Test 8+" @ $ 0.32 LF = $32,000

If you have any fquestions or if we can assist further do not hesitate to contact our office. Thank
you for the oppartunity to quote this project.

Sincerely,

/. S

Jamés D. Fagan, Jr.
President ;

Enc: Terms & Conditions
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Sewer Specialty Services Co., Inc.
2462 New Road
Leicester, New York 14481

Tty L Ter W

113012014
Tenms and Conditions
Inclugions
i ftem No. 1
To Fumish:
- Notification of residence
" Printed Logs with Colored photos of observation-upon Payment
* Traffic Safety set-up using cones, beacons and signs
hd Insurance Certificates
Exclusions
* Excavation of any type
* Locating or uncovering manholes
* Flagman extra
" Bypass pumping
" Water permits and disposal fees
Paggggj nt

Net 30 days or a 2% monthly service charge shall be imposed

Read gnd approved on by
Date Signature / Title

Clarfc Féatmfson- West Senaca, NY-smoke Testing
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STATE PIPE SERVICES, INC.

Utility Contractors ® Cleaning ® TVinspection € Grouting ® Pipe Bursting
Sliplining © Sewer Construction ® Waterline Construction @ “Strong Seal” Manhole Rehabilitation

January 28, 2014

George Kalkowsky

Clark Patterson Lee

26 Mississippi Street, Suite 300
Buffalo, NY 14203

Re:  Smoke Testing
West Seneca, NY

Via E-Mail: GKalkowsky@ClarkPatterson.com

Dear Mr. Kalkowsky:

We are pleased to submit our quote for the above referenced project.

State Pipe Services, Inc. will provide supervision, crew, sewer jet, notification of residents, fire
company & police, typed report of conditions observed, smoke bombs, blowers, sand bags,

plugs, and all miscellaneous safety equipment needed to complete this project.

Our price for the smoke testing of approximately 100,000 LF of 8" - 24" sanitary sewer is $0.39
per LF.

Thank you for the opportunity to quote on this project. If you have any questions or require
any additional information, please do not hesitate to contact our office.

Sincerely,
Dave Burns

Dave Burns
Vice President

DB/sb

7587 FRANKLIN ROAD ¢ CRANBERRY TOWNSHIP o PENNSYLVANIA 16066 » OFFICE 724-538-3500 = FAX 724-538-3150



Jason Foote

From: Mike Kerl <isis310@roadrunner.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2014 11:33 AM
To: George Kalkowsky
Subject: RE: Smoke Testing

George, Talked with Joe and it prices out at about $0.50/LF. Let me know how that works for you. Tks, Mike

From: George Kalkowsky [mailto:GKalkowsky@ClarkPatterson.com]
Sent: Monday, January 27, 2014 2:25 PM

To: isis310@roadrunner.com
Subject: Smoke Testing

Mike,
I don’t know if Jason has gotten to you about this yet, but we are seeking estimates for smoke testing for our Phase 4
sewer project. Attached is Phase4Smoke.pdf that outlines the sewers we need smoke tested. If you've got questions |

can answer them.

George Kalkowsky
800.274.9000 ext. 1310

Clark Patterson Lee

OLEIGH PROFLILIONALS

Fhepae conaider the arehronment pefos to prinding this senall,

s



